
CYPRESS GROVE COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT DISTRICT 
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS 

MINUTES 
 

Date: August 16, 2021 
8:00 A.M. 

 
Held at 

8756 Boynton Beach Boulevard, Suite 2100 
Boynton Beach, Florida 33472 

 
1. Roll Call   
 
 The meeting was called to order by Chair Walsey at 8:00 A.M. 
 
 The Secretary then called the roll, and noted that all Supervisors except Supervisor Duhaney were 

present. 
 
 In Attendance: 
 Board Members: Charles Walsey, Rick Elsner, Larry Portnoy, and Don Johnson, Supervisor Duhaney 

arrived at 8:15 A.M. 
 District Engineer: Alan Wertepny 
 District Attorney: Peter Breton 
 Operations Manager:   Robert Poyner, RLP Property Services, Inc. (by speaker phone) 
                                                                                                                        
2. Approval of Agenda   
 
 After a motion by Supervisor Elsner and second by Supervisor Johnson, the Board unanimously 

approved the agenda, 
    
3. Approval of Minutes 
 
 By motion by Supervisor Johnson and second by Supervisor Elsner, the Board unanimously approved 

the minutes of the Board of Supervisors’ Meeting of June 21, 2021. 
 
4.   Acceptance of Resignation of Supervisor Johnson 
 
 The Board received a letter of resignation from Supervisor Johnson, Upon motion by Supervisor Elsner 

and a second by Supervisor Portnoy, the Board unanimously approved the acceptance of Supervisor 
Johnson’s resignation.  The Chair expressed the District’s appreciation of Supervisor Johnson’s years of 
service and wished him well. 

 
5.    Appointment of Replacement for Supervisor Johnson 
 
 In accordance with the District’s governing statute, Supervisor Elsner made a motion to appoint Mr. 

Patrick Fogarty to serve as Supervisor for the balance of Supervisor Johnson’s term.  Supervisor 
Portnoy seconded the motion and the Board unanimously approved the motion.  Attorney Breton stated 
that he would send a written oath of office for Supervisor Fogarty to sign and return for filing in the 
District’s records.  The attorney also advised Supervisor Fogarty to file his initial financial disclosure form 
with the Supervisor of Elections and former Supervisor Johnson to file his final financial disclosure form 
with the Supervisor of Elections. 

 
6. Engineer's Report 
 
  The District Engineer had not yet arrived, so his presentation was deferred until later in the meeting. 
   
7. Operations Manager's Report 
 

The Operations Manager reported on the onsite and offsite water levels.  He said he is treating the 
canals.  He said that Pontano is getting ready to apply for additional irrigation water from SFWMD.  
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Pontano has an additional 10 acre parcel on the south side of Section 29, so Mr. Poyner expects that 
Pontano will request 2 connections to the canals, one on the north and one on the south. 
 
He updated the Board on his progress on canal bank clearing. 
 
He said that there is about 600 gallons of fuel remaining.  In response to the Treasurer’s question, he 
said he will definitely need to order one tanker delivery before the end of the year at 7000 gallons and 
possibly a second. 
 
He discussed his progress on resolving the trespassing problem.  He is working with the Sheriff’s Office 
and the game warden. 
 
He said he is working with FPL on getting a gate replaced in Section 4 and with SFWMD to move a gate 
on the L-8 Canal.  
 
He discussed the need for bank clearing in Santa Rosa Groves and the timing in regard to any road 
improvements in that section.  
     

8. Treasurer's Report 
 

The Treasurer reported that he estimated the District will have $93,000 going forward after taking out 4 
months of operations at $25,000 per month, 2 more fuel deliveries at $10,000 each and $10,000 for 
insurance.  
 
Next was a discussion of the FY 2021-2022 budget.  The attorney distributed copies of the budget which 
he said was identical to the preliminary budget approved in May, with the exception that the line of credit 
payment was increased by $10,000 and the canal maintenance line item was reduced by the same 
$10,000.  The total and the maintenance assessment rate remains the same. 
 

9. Public Hearing on 2021-2022 Budget and 2021-2022 Non-ad Valorem Assessment Rate 
 
The Chair then announced that the public hearing on the FY 2021-2022 budget and the FY 2021-2022 
Non-ad Valorem Assessment Rate was open.  The District Attorney stated for the record that the public 
hearing was duly noticed in the Palm Beach Post and that letters were mailed to all property owners in 
the District at the address in the tax rolls. There being no members of the public desiring to speak, the 
Chair closed the public hearing. 
 

10. Discussion of Revisions to 2021-2022 Budget and 2021-2022 Non-ad Valorem Assessment Rate 
 
 The Board did not make any revisions to the budget or non-ad valorem assessment rate. 
 
11. Motion to Adopt Resolution Approving 2021-2022 Budget 
 
 Upon motion by Supervisor Elsner and second by Supervisor Portnoy, Resolution No 2021-2 adopting 
 the FY 2021-2022 final budget as presented was unanimously approved. 
 
12. Motion to Adopt Resolution Approving 2021-2022 Non-ad Valorem Assessment Rate 
 

 Upon motion by Supervisor Elsner and second by Supervisor Portnoy, Resolution No 2021-3 adopting 
 the FY 2021-2022 final Non-ad Valorem Assessment Rate of $75.39 per acre was unanimously 
 approved 

   
13. Attorney's Report 

 
The Attorney stated that there will be elections in November. 
 

14.  Engineer’s Report 
 

The District Engineer arrived and distributed copies of his written report (copy attached).  He explained 
the issues with the Corps of Engineers LOSOM revision. Potential impacts on the District’s water supply 
were discussed.  
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15. Comments by Supervisors 
 

Supervisor Portnoy updated the Board on the progress on the incorporation of the Acreage into a new 
city. 
 
There were no further comments by Supervisors.    

 
16. Comments by Public 
 

 There were no members of the public present. 
 
17. Announcement of Next Meeting Date 
 

The Chair announced that the next meeting would occur on September 20, 2021 at 8:00 A.M. at 8756 
Boynton Beach Boulevard, Suite 2100, Boynton Beach, Florida 33472. 
  

18. Adjournment 
 

 Upon motion by Supervisor Elsner, seconded by Supervisor Duhaney the meeting was adjourned at 
8:45 A.M. 

 
  
 
_______________________________________  _____________________________________ 
Charles C. Walsey, Chair     Peter L. Breton, Secretary 
 

 
 








